
  

  

BATTLE OF LOS ANGELES' FINEST TAKES CENTER STAGE 

AS UNDEFEATED WORLD CHAMPION LEO SANTA CRUZ TAKES ON  
FORMER THREE-DIVISION WORLD CHAMPION ABNER MARES ON  

PREMIER BOXING CHAMPIONS ON ESPN 10 P.M. ET/7 P.M. PT 
 

SATURDAY, AUGUST 29 AT STAPLES CENTER 

 
 

Press Conference To Formally Announce Fight Takes Place Next Tuesday, July 14  
At Plaza Mexico in Los Angeles 

  
LOS ANGELES (July 9, 2015) - The highly anticipated showdown between undefeated star Leo 
"El Terremoto" Santa Cruz (30-0-1, 17 KOs) and former three-division world champion Abner 
Mares (29-1-1, 15 KOs) is official as the two beloved stars that call Southern California home 
will fight in their own backyard at STAPLES Center in Los Angeles onSaturday, August 29 live in 
primetime on ESPN. Televised coverage for this long awaited event begins at 10 p.m. ET/7 p.m. 
PT. 
  
To kick things off, an open-to-the-public fan rally and press conference will be held next 
Tuesday, July 14 at 4:30 p.m. PT at Plaza Mexico in Los Angeles.  Both Santa Cruz and Mares 
will be in attendance. Fans are encouraged to arrive early.  
  
Tickets for the August 29th event, which is promoted by TGB Promotions, are priced at $25, 
$50, $75, $150 and $200, not including applicable fees and service charges, go on sale 
tomorrow Friday, July 10 at 10:00 a.m. (PST) at AXS.com or by phone at 888-929-7849 or at 
the STAPLES Center starting Saturday, July 11 at 10:00 am (PST). 
  



 
"I'm really excited for this fight, it's a fight the fans have been asking for and I'm ready to give 
them what they want - a great show and a great victory," said Mares. "L.A. is my home, I train 
here, grew up here and I'm ready to show this city and the world that I am the champ. I'm proud 
to be part of this great event on ESPN at Staples Centers.   Boxing is bigger than 
ever.  Whatever you do, don't miss this fight.   
  
Born in Guadalajara, Jalisco, Mexico and fighting out of Downey, Calif., Mares first tasted world 
championship gold in 2011 when he beat Joseph Agbeko to win the bantamweight world title. 
He continued his rise up the pound-for-pound list with wins over Anselmo Moreno and Daniel 
Ponce De Leon to win world titles at super bantamweight and featherweight respectively. The 
29-year-old has won three straight fights including his first PBC appearance in a victory over 
Arturo Reyes in March. He will look to add another career milestone and take hometown 
bragging rights by defeating the unbeaten Santa Cruz.  
  
"This fight means so much to me because I know it is what the fans have been waiting for," said 
Santa Cruz. "The opportunity to fight at STAPLES Center against a Mexican warrior and great 
fighter in Abner Mares is one that I plan on taking very seriously. We have been preparing for 
this moment for a very long time and I'm so glad it's finally here. A win is going to take one of us 
to the next level." 
  
A two-division world champion with a fan-friendly style, the 26-year-old Santa Cruz won his first 
world title in 2012 before adding another belt in 2013, which he defended four times. Unbeaten 
as a pro, Santa Cruz moved up in weight in his last fight and handedly defeated Jose Cayetano 
on the pay-per-view undercard of the record-breaking Floyd Mayweather vs. Manny Pacquiao 
fight. Born and raised in Los Angeles to Mexican parents, Santa Cruz faces the toughest 
challenge of his career when he squares off against the Mexican warrior Mares. 
  
This explosive fight comes to primetime on ESPN in one of the most revered venues in Los 
Angeles in the STAPLES Center. Santa Cruz vs. Mares continues a longstanding history of top 
local fighters competing in front of rabid Los Angeles boxing fans and marks the first fight at 
STAPLES Center in nearly three years. The last fight at the famed arena took place on 
November 10, 2012 and featured both Santa Cruz and Mares in the main and co-main events.  
  



 
"All of us here at STAPLES Center could not be more excited to host this incredible fight in 
downtown Los Angeles," Lee Zeidman, President, STAPLES Center. "It is an honor to have 
these two talented fighters in Mares and Santa Cruz bring this bout to their hometown and to all 
their fans here in Southern California, it will undoubtedly be a historic night for boxing." 
  
"We're honored to bring this highly anticipated showdown between Leo Santa Cruz and Abner 
Mares to the great Southern California boxing fans," said Tom Brown of TGB Promotions. "Leo 
and Abner have risen to the top of the sport and this much talked about battle at the STAPLES 
Center is a fight not to be missed." 
  
In addition to the evening's main event and co-main event, which will be announced shortly, 
select undercard bouts will be carried live on ESPN3. ESPN Deportes will also televise the fight 
live as part of its Noche de Combates series and ESPN International will present live coverage 
across its networks in Latin America, Brazil, the Caribbean and the Pacific Rim. Live coverage 
will also be available through WatchESPN on computers, smartphones, tablets, Amazon Fire TV 
and Fire TV Stick, Apple TV, Chromecast, Roku, Xbox 360 and Xbox One via an affiliated video 
provider. 
  
For more information visit www.premierboxingchampions.com, www.staplescenter.com and 
www.TGBPromotions.com. Follow on Twitter @PremierBoxing, @LeoSantaCruz2 
@AbnerMares, @ESPNBoxing, @STAPLESCenter, @TGBPromotions and @Swanson_Comm 
and become a fan on Facebook at www.Facebook.com/PremierBoxingChampions, 
www.facebook.com/STAPLESCenter and www.facebook.com/ESPN. Follow the conversation 
using #PBConESPN. 
  
CONTACTS:   Swanson Communications: (202) 783-5500 

                        Michael Donahue, Premier Boxing Champions: (630) 441-8080 

   Bernie Bahrmasel, TGB Promotions: (773) 592-2986 

   Stephen McDonald, ESPN: (860) 766-0523 

   Cara Vanderhook, STAPLES Center: (213) 742-7273 

   Media Credentials: www.magnamedia.com 

  

 


